
Disclaimers 

● Tax Disclaimer: Please check with your tax and legal professional as Sponsor, and its affiliates, 
do not provide tax or legal advice and the above is not intended to nor should be construed as 
such advice. Your specific circumstances may, and likely will, vary. 

● Financial Disclaimer: The financial figures shown above are intended for illustrative purposes 
only to explain general real estate concepts and are not guaranteed by Sponsor, or any of its 
affiliates. Real estate investing involves many risks, variables, and uncertainties. No 
representations or warranties are made that any investor will, or is likely to, attain the returns 
shown above since hypothetical or simulated performance is not an indicator or assurance of 
future results. 
 

● Investment Risk Disclaimer:  There are risks associated with investing in real estate and 
securities in general. Investing involves risk of loss including loss of principal. Some high-risk 
investments which use leverage may accentuate gains and losses. Past investment performance is 
not a guarantee or predictor of future investment performance. 
 

● Investment Advice Disclaimer: This content is for informational purposes only. Sponsor and its 
affiliates do not provide legal, tax, investment, financial, or other advice. All content presented is 
information of a general nature and does not address the circumstances of any particular 
individual. 

 
● Testimonials: The testimonials, statements, and opinions presented are applicable to the 

individuals listed. Results will vary and may not be representative of the experience of others. 
The testimonials are voluntarily provided and are not paid, nor were they provided with free 
products, services, or any benefits in exchange for said statements. The testimonials are 
representative of client experience, but the exact results and experience will be unique and 
individual to each client. 

● Past Performance and Future Results: Any performance data shared by Sponsor represents past 
performance and past performance does not guarantee future results. Neither Sponsor nor any of 
its investments are required by law to follow any standard methodology when calculating and 
representing performance date and the performance of any such funds may not be directly 
comparable to the performance of other private or registered offerings. 

● Not An Offer/Sale of Securities: This is for informational purposes only and does not constitute 
an offer to sell any securities. Any offers to purchase securities will only be made pursuant to a 
private placement memorandum and other appropriate offering documents in accordance with 
applicable securities laws. The information contained herein is subject to change without notice 
and should not be relied upon for making investment decisions.  

● Subjective Information: Please note that these numbers are not calculated by an independent 
appraiser or any other independent third party.  


